
Description

Maintenance of Traffic Signals Amount Amount Amount Amount

Technician Hourly Rate $70.00 $100.00 $140.00 $145.00

Electrician Hourly Rate $85.00 $100.00 $140.00 $158.00

Helper Hourly Rate $45.00 $50.00 $18.00 $92.00

Flaggers Hourly Rate $55.00 $45.00 $18.00 $55.00

Police Dept Detail Hourly $101.00 $101.00 $101.00 $101.00

Off Hours Hourly Rate $120.00 $150.00 $140.00 $205.00

Emergency Call Out Flat Rate $150.00 $300.00 $140.00 $50.00

Equipment Van Hourly Rate $45.00 $50.00 $1.00 $30.00

Bucket Truck Hourly Rate $60.00 $150.00 $1.00 $55.00

Auger Truck Hourly Rate $60.00 $175.00 $1.00 $205.00

Maintenance of City Owned Street Lights Amount Amount Amount Amount

Technician Hourly Rate $70.00 $100.00 $140.00 $145.00

Electrician Hourly Rate $85.00 $100.00 $140.00 $158.00

Helper Hourly Rate $45.00 $50.00 $18.00 $92.00

Flaggers Hourly Rate $55.00 $45.00 $18.00 $55.00

Police Dept Detail Hourly $101.00 $101.00 $101.00 $101.00

Off Hours Hourly Rate $120.00 $150.00 $140.00 $205.00

Emergency Call Out Flat Rate $150.00 $300.00 $140.00 $50.00

Equipment Van Hourly Rate $45.00 $50.00 $1.00 $30.00

Bucket Truck Hourly Rate $60.00 $150.00 $1.00 $55.00

Auger Truck Hourly Rate $60.00 $175.00 $1.00 $205.00

Maintenance of City Owned Facilities Amount Amount Amount Amount

Technician Hourly Rate No Bid No Bid $140.00 $105.00

Electrician Hourly Rate No Bid No Bid $140.00 $150.00

Helper Hourly Rate No Bid No Bid $18.00 $92.00

Off Hours Hourly Rate No Bid No Bid $140.00 $205.00

Emergency Call Out Flat Rate No Bid No Bid $140.00 $50.00

Equipment Van Hourly Rate No Bid No Bid $1.00 $30.00

Bucket Truck Hourly Rate No Bid No Bid $1.00 $55.00

Purchased Parts Mark Up Percentage 10.00% 10.00% 10.00% 10.00%
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